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1. China’s Agenda 21 
 
1.1 China’s Agenda 21 and round table meeting 
 
China’s Agenda 21 provides an excellent example of international cooperation. In order 
to promote sustainable development in China, the Chinese government has adopted two 
strategies for long-term development, i.e. ‘To prosper China by Science and Education’, 
and ‘Sustainable Development’. The government has formulated wide-range flexible 
policies in its international relations.  
 
1.2. Priority projects 
 
Under the leadership of the State Planning Committee (renamed the State Economic 
Development Committee) and the State Science and Technology Committee (renamed 
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the State Science and Technology Ministry), a Priority Program for China’s Agenda 21 
was established. It contains the following projects: 

 Priority 1. Capacity Building for Sustainable Development; 
 Priority 2. Sustainable Agriculture; 
 Priority 3. Clean Production and Environmental Protection Industry; 
 Priority 4. Clean Energy and Transportation; 
 Priority 5. Conservation and Sustainable Utilization of Natural Resources; 
 Priority 6. Environmental Pollution Control; 
 Priority 7. Combating Poverty and Regional Development; 
 Priority 8. Population, Health and Human Settlements; 
 Priority 9. Global Change and Biodiversity Conservation. 

 
2. Extensive institutional cooperation 
 
International cooperation programs in other fields are also carried out through various 
institutions or among ministries, local governments, NGOs, enterprises, etc. Many 
international institutions, such as UNDP, UNEP, World Bank, Asian Development Bank, 
have made contributions in this area. 
 
The government of the People’s Republic of China has a common understanding of the 
present world situation: peace and development are two major issues in the international 
community and world politics. The Chinese government seeks world peace and 
development based on United Nations doctrine and principles, especially mutual respect 
of sovereignty and territorial integrity, mutual non-aggression, non-interference in 
internal affairs, and equity, mutual benefit and peaceful co-existence. China seeks all 
round international cooperation in environment and development issues, not only with 
developed countries like USA, Japan, and the European Community, but also with many 
developing countries of the third world, especially with surrounding countries like 
Russia, Korea, and the South-east Asian countries. Through various forms of multiple or 
bilateral cooperation, China is going to do good job in solution of many difficult 
problems encountered in global environment and development issues, making the cradle 
of human civilization a common and beautiful homeland for humanity. 
 
It is predicated that the total investment in the first batch of PPCA21 (Priority Projects 
of China’s Agenda 21) projects will be US$4.3 billion. China is providing 60% and the 
remaining 40% will hopefully be available from the international community. It is 
possible to carry out international cooperation in various flexible ways, e.g. donation, 
technical support, credit (soft credit included), exclusive investment, joint-venture, 
cooperation, BOT, etc.. 
 
3. Index of China’s sustainable development and related assessment methods 
 
The project aims at establishing an index system for the overall situation of China’s 
sustainable development in the national economy, society, natural resources and 
environment, to provide government and the public with a clear understanding of the 
situation. It is expected that the project will be based on development control and 
regulation mechanisms, in order to strengthen steps toward China’s sustainable 
development and its effectiveness. 
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China is currently in a phase of rapid economic growth. Along with implementation of 
the reform and opening policy and the great success of economic development, China is 
under enormous pressure from population growth, environmental deterioration and 
depletion of natural resources. In order to counter this pressure, the government 
formulated the state strategy of sustainable development. 
 
To indicate and assess the overall pattern of China’s sustainable development, it is 
necessary to set up an index and a related system of assessment methods, that can 
quantify the degree of realization towards sustainable development targets, and 
gradually bring the system into national account auditing and statistics. This is a 
fundamental step toward sustainable society and economic development. The 
establishment of an index system is going to reform present pattern of economic growth 
and becomes an important milestone in execution of the principles and action plans in 
China’s Agenda 21.  
 
Traditionally, SNA (System of National Accounts) was the main tool for measuring 
economic development. As part of SNA, the Gross National Product (GNP) and other 
economic indices were used to measure major economic activity and to represent the 
extent of target realization. The shortcomings of GNP as an index for measuring the 
development state of a country are becoming obvious. Since the early 1980s, China’s 
accounting system has been closer to the international accounting system. China 
currently uses 19 statistical indices, to indicate economic growth and social 
development, concentrating mainly on economic growth. Although some environmental 
indices of material consumption are included, they only passively represent 
environmental conditions and material consumption, cannot actively examine the extent 
of coordination between development and population, resources, environment, and 
economy. Therefore, an important step in implementation of the sustainable 
development strategy, is to improve the present indices, to make them more meaningful, 
while measuring development scientifically and comprehensively. 
 
There are various international indices for measuring sustainable development. In 1990, 
UNDP (United Nations Development Programme) initiated the Human Development 
Index (HDI), which is based on three basic variables: life expectancy at birth, 
educational level and real GDP (Gross Domestic Product). The World Bank issued the 
newest and most advanced index of sustainable development in 1995. This takes 
continuous growth of per capita social wealth as the major indicator for a country’s level 
and realization of sustainable development. Canada, USA, the Netherlands and other 
countries have also put forward indices to measure sustainable development. 
 
China’s strategy for sustainable development is entering the implementation stage. 
China’s Agenda 21 has already been incorporated into the national economy and social 
development planning, and it has provided a very good opportunity for sustainable 
development index studies and formulation. In recent years, some scholars from the 
Administrative Center of China’s Agenda 21, the Chinese Academy of sciences, 
Chinese Academy of Social Sciences, State Statistics Bureau and certain universities 
have devoted enormous effort in collecting and assessing the results of studies of 
international index systems. They have assimilated great quantities of results in setting 
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up an index system for assessing the natural environment, and the State Statistics 
Bureau has organized experts to study and assess China’s integrated index of social and 
economic development. All this work has helped to lay a sound foundation for the 
project. 
 
The objectives of the project are as follows: 
 
Long-term. Establishment of an effective and applicable index system for China’s 
sustainable development and related assessment methods, that can be brought into the 
national accounting system, after regional testing and necessary training, generally 
following international standards. 
 
Short-term. Development of an index system for China’s sustainable development 
through analyses on and comparison between present international and domestic 
statistical methods and the present index system for sustainable development, which is 
based on major impact assessment factors and relevant development issues. 
 
Studies on investigation and assessment of sustainable development both in China and 
the world have been completed. A network of experts has been established, involving 
sustainable development index studies in various fields, both at home and abroad, and a 
project group composed of governmental departments, scientific research institutions 
and other organizations has been formed. Assessment is being carried out on progress of 
international studies related to sustainable development indices. International 
cooperation and exchanges are being promoted, and there is corresponding tracking 
between China’s studies and international studies. 
 
 
- 
- 
- 
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